
 

Labourers of the Harvest – REFERENCES 
 
CHAPTER 9: BALANCING WORK AND FAMILY 
 
The following are extracts of the references listed in this chapter of Labourers of the 
Harvest.  
 
  
 
A. Laborem Exercens (On Human Work) 

Pope John Paul II  
14 September 1981 
Paragraphs 6, 10, 42-45 

 
 
6. It is certainly true that work, as a human issue, is at the very center of the "social 
question" to which, for almost a hundred years, since the publication of the above 
mentioned encyclical, the church's teaching and the many undertakings connected with 
her apostolic mission have been especially directed. The present reflections on work are 
not intended to follow a different line, but rather to be in organic connection with the 
whole tradition of this teaching and activity. At the same time, however, I am making 
them, according to the indication in the Gospel, in order to bring out from the heritage 
of the Gospel "what is new and what is old". Certainly, work is part of "what is old" – as 
old as man and his life on earth. Nevertheless, the general situation of man in the 
modern world, studied and analyzed in its various aspects of geography, culture and 
civilization, calls for the discovery of the new meanings of human work. It likewise 
calls for the formulation of the new tasks that in this sector face each individual, the 
family, each country, the whole human race and finally the church herself. 
 
10. In the midst of all these processes--those of the diagnosis of objective social reality 
and also those of the church's teaching in the sphere of the complex and many-sided 
social question--the question of human work naturally appears many times. This issue 
is, in a way, a constant factor both of social life and of the church's teaching. 
Furthermore, in this teaching attention to the question goes back much further than the 
last ninety years. In fact the church's social teaching finds its source in sacred scripture, 
beginning with the Book of Genesis and especially in the Gospel and the writings of the 
apostles. From the beginning it was part of the church's teaching, her concept of man 
and life in society, and, especially the social morality which she worked out according 
to the needs of the different ages. This traditional patrimony was then inherited and 
developed by the teaching of the popes on the modern "social question", beginning with 
the encyclical Rerum Novarum. In this context, study of the question of work, as we 
have seen, has continually been brought up to date while maintaining that Christian 
basis of truth which can be called ageless. 
 
42. Having thus confirmed the personal dimension of human work, we must go on to 
the second sphere of values which is necessarily linked to work. Work constitutes a 
foundation for the formation of family life, which is a natural right and something that 
man is called to. These two spheres of values – one linked to work and the other 
consequent on the family nature of human life – must be properly united and must 
properly permeate each other. In a way, work is a condition for making it possible to 
found a family, since the family requires the means of subsistence which man normally 
gains through work. Work and industriousness also influence the whole process of 



 

education in the family, for the very reason that everyone "becomes a human being" 
through, among other things, work, and becoming a human being is precisely the main 
purpose of the whole process of education. Obviously, two aspects of work in a sense 
come into play here: the one making family life and its upkeep possible, and the other 
making possible the achievement of the purposes of the family, especially education. 
Nevertheless, these two aspects of work are linked to one another and are mutually 
complementary in various points. 
 
43. It must be remembered and affirmed that the family constitutes one of the most 
important terms of reference for shaping the social and ethical order of human work. 
The teaching of the church has always devoted special attention to this question, and in 
the present document we shall have to return to it. In fact, the family is simultaneously a 
community made possible by work and the first school of work, within the home, for 
every person.  
 
44. The third sphere of values that emerges from this point of view – that of the subject 
of work – concerns the great society to which man belongs on the basis of particular 
cultural and historical links. This society – even when it has not yet taken on the mature 
form of a nation – is not only the great "educator" of every man, even though an indirect 
one (because each individual absorbs within the family the contents and values that go 
to make up the culture of a given nation); it is also a great historical and social 
incarnation of the work of all generations. All of this brings it about that man combines 
his deepest human identity with membership of a nation, and intends his work also to 
increase the common good developed together with his compatriots, thus realizing that 
in this way work serves to add to the heritage of the whole human family, of all the 
people living in the world.  
 
45. These three spheres are always important for human work in its subjective 
dimension. And this dimension, that is to say, the concrete reality of the worker, takes 
precedence over the objective dimension. In the subjective dimension there is realized, 
first of all, that "dominion" over the world of nature to which man is called from the 
beginning according to the words of the Book of Genesis. The very process of 
"subduing the earth," that is to say work, is marked in the course of history and 
especially in recent centuries by an immense development of technological means. This 
is an advantageous and positive phenomenon, on condition that the objective dimension 
of work does not gain the upper hand over the subjective dimension, depriving man of 
his dignity and inalienable rights or reducing.  
 
 
 
B. Rerum Novarum (On Capital and Labour) 

Pope Leo XIII 
15 May 1891 
Paragraph 42 

 
42. If we turn not to things external and material, the first thing of all to secure is to save 
unfortunate working people from the cruelty of men of greed, who use human beings as 
mere instruments for money-making. It is neither just nor human so to grind men down 
with excessive labour as to stupefy their minds and wear out their bodies. Man's powers, 
like his general nature, are limited, and beyond these limits he cannot go. His strength is 
developed and increased by use and exercise, but only on condition of due intermission 
and proper rest. Daily labour, therefore, should be so regulated as not to be protracted 



 

over longer hours than strength admits. How many and how long the intervals of rest 
should be must depend on the nature of the work, on circumstances of time and place, 
and on the health and strength of the workman. Those who work in mines and quarries, 
and extract coal, stone and metals from the bowels of the earth, should have shorter 
hours in proportion as their labour is more severe and trying to health. Then, again, the 
season of the year should be taken into account; for not unfrequently a kind of labour is 
easy at one time which at another is intolerable or exceedingly difficult. Finally, work 
which is quite suitable for a strong man cannot rightly be required from a woman or a 
child. And, in regard to children, great care should be taken not to place them in 
workshops and factories until their bodies and minds are sufficiently developed. For, 
just as very rough weather destroys the buds of spring, so does too early an experience 
of life's hard toil blight the young promise of a child's faculties, and render any true 
education impossible. Women, again, are not suited for certain occupations; a woman is 
by nature fitted for home-work, and it is that which is best adapted at once to preserve 
her modesty and to promote the good bringing up of children and the well-being of the 
family. As a general principle it may be laid down that a workman ought to have leisure 
and rest proportionate to the wear and tear of his strength, for waste of strength must be 
repaired by cessation from hard work.  
 
In all agreements between masters and work people there is always the condition 
expressed or understood that there should be allowed proper rest for soul and body. To 
agree in any other sense would be against what is right and just; for it can never be just 
or right to require on the one side, or to promise on the other, the giving up of those 
duties which a man owes to his God and to himself.  


